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(1) Contract #(s):

(4) Sunnyside Foundation

(5) TIN:

(2) Period Covered:

(6) ADDRESS: 2238 E. Ginter Road Tucson, Arizona 85706

(3) CONTRACT ON FILE:

(7) MAILING INSTRUCTIONS: Please call Angie @8711 when check is ready for pick up.

FINANCE DEPT

USE ONLY
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INVOICE PROJECT U.T. 1099 INVOICE
LINE AMOUNT | INVOICE NUMBER | INVOICE DATE | FUND | ACCT.NO. | CENTER FUND PROJECT CODE | CODE CODE GROSS AMOUNT
$45.00 10/10/12 1000 | 54009 1100106 $45.00 |
| I R

(19) FOR FINANCE DEPARTMENT USE ONLY

AUDITED __VENDOR#

BY APPROVED BY

FACTOR #

DUE DATE

DIRECT PAYMENTS

Future: Pathways to Success Lunchoen

Suunyside Foundation-Inaugural Funding our

COUNTY DEPARTMENT CERTIFICATION:

I have examined this demand; expenditure is for a valid public purpose and funds have been
appropriated or are otherwise available for payment of this demand; and if the funds are from a
Federal grant, contract or source, this demand is allowable under the terms of such graut,
contract or source; and payment of the amount claimed is hereby approved.

(20) PURCHASING DEPARTMENT APPROVAL:

(22) DATE(S) COVERED:

10/11/2012

APPROVED BY DEPARTMENT DIRECTOR/DESIGNATED AUTHORITY:

\\\\\DRNI

DATE

(23) SIGNATURE




Keith Bagwell -

From: Hope E. Cramer

Sent: Wednesday, October 10, 2012 11:37 AM
To: Keith Bagwell

Subject: FW: Sunnyside Foundation Luncheon
Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Flagged

Keith, Richard has asked me to put this on his calendar & Marisol will RSVP for him —could you get a
check ordered for payment?
Thanks,

Hope Cramer

Special Staff Assistant to Supervisor Richard Elias
Pima County Board of Supervisors, District Five
hope.cramer@pima.gov | 520.724.8748

gie

From: REAADVERTISING@aol.com [mailto:REAADVERTISING@aol.com]
Sent: Monday, October 08, 2012 4:35 PM

To: reaadvertising@aol.com

Subject: Sunnyside Foundation Luncheon

Hello All,

The Sunnyside Foundation- Inaugural Funding our Future: Pathways to Success Luncheon is on Thursday October 11th @
11:30 at Casino del Sol and will be honoring Gus Chavez with a Lifetime Education Legacy Award.

Please consider attending, the tickets are $45.00 per person. If you'd like to RSVP, I'd be happy to help with that.

Let me know. Felicidades Gus!

Marisol Flores-Aguirre
Director,Media & Promotions
REA Media Group
602-751-7241 C
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