Stella Padilla

From: Kiki Navarro

Sent: Wednesday, May 08, 2013 9:13 AM
To: Stella Padilla

Subject: FW: 2013 Community Festival Funds

Hi Stella can you submit a claim for 900.00 under account 5315 payable to Friends of Robles Ranch. Thank you

Kiki Navarro

Supervisor Sharon Bronson's office

District 3

(520) 724-8051 (Please note the new phone number!)

From: Anjanette Miller-Bonney [mailto:roblesconnector@gmail.com]
Sent: Tuesday, May 07, 2013 3:53 PM

To: Kiki Navarro

Subject: 2013 Community Festival Funds

Dear Kiki,

[ would like to request funds for our annual Robles Junction/Three Points Community Festival, on behalf of the
Community Festival Committee. This will be our 6th year celebrating our community and neighbors. If you are
able, please make the check out to the Friends of Robles Ranch and list "Festival” in the memo or invoice.

We greatly appreciate the support from yourself and the rest of the staff at Supervisor Bronson's Office on
behalf of our community.

Anjanette Miller

Robles Junction/Three Points Community Connector

La Frontera Prevention Services

Office located at the Historic Robles Ranch Community Center
roblesconnector@qgmail.com




