J.PMorgan

ACCOUNT NUMBER BILLING DATE DUE DATE NEW BALANCE ENTER PAYMENT AMT
XXX XKXX XXXK 9299 11/29/13 12/13M13 0.00 DO NOT PAY

38041 CLGC 001 020 33313 - NNNNNNNNNNNN
ROBERT LARKINS

PIMA COUNTY

150 W CONGRESS ST3RD FL
FACILITIES

TUCSON AZ 85701-0000

"lllllilllllll"lllllll"l!l”ll"llllullll'l'lil“llll!ll"

33353040020203804 104

ACCOUNT NO. XXXX XXXX XXXX 9299 BILLING DATE: 11/29/13 DUE DATE: 121313 CREDIT LIMIT: 5,000.00
- ACCOUNT SUMMARY -
Previous Balance | (-} Payments, Credits | (+) Charges, Cash Debits | {(+) Finance Charges [+} Fees {=) New Balance Payment Due
0.00 0.00 317.47 0.00 0.00 0.00 DO NOT PAY
CURRENT TRANSACTIONS {-OUTSTANDING DISPUTES) 0.00 + PAST DUE AMOUNT 0.00 = TO¥AL 0.00
POST | TRAN TRANSACTION DETAIL CHARGES CREDITS NOTES
112t | 11720 | STAPLES B77-8267755 NJ 147
REF NO: 24164073324105191502445 AUTH NO: 0362B6
CUSTOMER ID LOCAL TAX INCL NATLTAX  INCL OTHER TAX
7109136261000001 23.79 1 000 0 0.00
MERGHANT VAT/GST ID CUSTOMER VAT/GST ID SUMM COMM CD
DISCOUNT FREIGHT DUTY VAT REG # ORDER DATE
GO0 000 0.00 1119113
DESTINATION CNTRY SHIP FROM
B5701 85353
ITEM COMM.CODE ITEM DESCRIFTION aTy umT UNIT €OS7 VAT/TAX
2 §15518 RDRD BK 50PG 35LN 7.00 EA 23.3% 0.00
3 102394 MCKEE CHAIR 1,00 EA 129.85 0G0
TOTAL ACTIVITY 1747 0.00

" - * * *

THE ABOVE LISTED TRANSACTIONS HAVE TRANSFERRED TO THIS ACCOUNT'S
ASSOCIATED CENTRAL BILL ACCOUNT. THE NET BALANCE WAS 317.47

PLEASE NOTE THAT ANY FOREIGN PURCHASES AND/OR FOREIGN CASH
DISBURSEMENT TRANSACTIONS MAY INCLLUDE A 1% INTERNATIONAL
TRANSACTION FEE.

This is NOT a bill.
Your company will submit payment for your account.

Paymenis or credits received after billiag date above will appear on next month's statement.

FOR INQUIRIES ABOUT YOUR ACCOUNT, PLEASE CALL 1-800-270-7760 OR WRITE US:

COMMERCIAL CARD SCLUTIONS, PO BOX 2030, ELGIN, IL 60121-2030.

FOR TTY/TDD Service CALL: 1-800-955-8060

Do not deduct any amount thal is showing in dispute on your statement, this amouni has aiready been deducled from the amount due.
Please see reverse side for important information regarding certain types of charges or disputed charges.
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. Trensaction Detail

Transactions Reporls  Help

Transaction Detail

General Information E Addendum E History

{"save | [ Remove Unes | Dispute |

L2 <Previgus 7 of 28 Nextz =]

Settlement Method Commerclal Card

Transaction Type Purchase

Account Number ***¥*+*r¥¥¥x60200
Transaction Date 11/20/13
Post Date 11/21/13

MCC 5111
Merchant STAPLES
877-8267755, N1, US

Original Merchant STAPLES
Parent Merchant STAPLES

Exported ;"

Custoemer Code 7109136261000001
Micro Reference 24164073324105193502445
Authorization Number 036286
Transaction ID 1208077467001

Qriginal Currency USD
Original Amount $317.47
Tax $23.79
Sattiement Currency USD
Total $317.47

Transaction Notes

Cate: 11719/13
Order # 7108135261

2367 characters remaining.

https://www.paymentnet.jpmorgan.com/app/transaction/detail 7id=1209077467001 &amp:s...

Ling Totals
{¥] Line Stem Level Accounting 100% $317.47
Item  Resgrigtion £ of Units Unit Price Taxable 2 Total
? [Commerclat Card Purchase | [1.00 ] [140.48 | ] 140.48
Accounting Codes
Chart of Accounts! Pima Default COA 5 '
* DEPARTMENT  [BCS - BOS +
i* FUND-UNIT 1000-0025 - GENERAL FUND-DISTRIC] ¥ |
i* OBIECT 5021 - FURNITURE <1000 -]
:PROGRAM-PRGM e
{PHASE-PREM [None |;j Transaction Custom Fields
{PERIOD
gTASI( QORDER None Reconciled
;FUNCI'ION Nane Approved
ENTER SALES TAX {1053 f e
'ENTER FREIGHT
MASTER
‘AGREEMENT [12008000000000000069
INUMBER
Iiem Description #of Units Unit Price Taxable 2 Tatal
5 [Commerdal Cord Purchoge | [0 | f7ess ] o wess@][+]
Accounting Codes B :
Chart of Accounts|Pima Cefault COA v e e o
* DEPARTMENT FM - FAC MGMT . 1 Transaction Custom Fields
* FUND-UNIT 5009-0371 - PARKING GARAGES-ELPH = )
* DBIECT 5000 - OFFICE SUPPLIES 2} Reconciled
PROGRAM-PRGM ] Approved
'PHASE-PRGM None E3]
‘PERIOD

12/9/2013



Transaction Detail Page 2 of 2

‘TASK ORDER None

FUNCTION Mone te |

{ENTER SALES TAX |13.26

JENTER FRELGHT

IMASTER

{AGREEMENT |1200000E3000000000[269

INUMBER

i< =Pravious 7 of 28 Nexts =1

i€ 2013 JPMargan Chase & Co. All rights reserved. Privacy Polioy and Disrlosyres | Terms @ Conditions

https://www.paymentnet.jpmorgan.com/app/transaction/detail?id=1209077467001 &amp:s...  12/9/2013



1000/0025 ~ 371 TOTAL

$120.85 §183.73

ltem § $129.95 $163.73 $293.68
Discount § 0.00 0.00 0.00
Subtotal 129.85 163.73 293.68
Tax 10.53 13.26 0.00 23.79

Total § witax 140.48< 176.99 317.47
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Suzanne Goodman

R R
From: Robert Larkins
Sent: Monday, November 25, 2013 13:26 AM
To: Suzanne Goodman
Subject: FW: Message from KMBT_C652

Here you go, sorry about that.

Robert Larkins
Administrative Specialist
Parking Operations
724-3771

—---Original Message-—-

From: Sara Hill

Sent: Monday, November 18, 2013 1:45 PM
To: Robert Larkins

Subject: FW: Message from KMBT_C652

Thanks here is the unit number 0025.

Thank you,
Sara Hill

-----0riginal Message———

From: Tom Gordon

Sent: Friday, November 15, 2013 4:55 PM
To: Sara Hill

Subject: FW: Message from KMBT_C652

Sara - here's the unit number for the Staples chair. Fund 1000. if Robert can 'unblock’ and buy the chair - great. If not,
Nina wilt do it.

Thanks,

Tom Gordon, RA

Pima County Facilities Management
Renovations & Interiors Manager
Ph. 520-724-3774

e-mail: tom.gordon@pima.gov

————— Original Message-----

From: Evangelina Quihuis

Sent: Friday, November 15, 2013 4:04 PM
To: Tom Gordaon



Subject: RE: Message from KMBT_C652
Thanks here is the unit number 0025.

————— Original Message——-

From: Tom Gordon

Sent: Friday, November 15, 2013 4:02 PM
To: Nina Schatz; Evangelina Quihuis

Cc: Sara Hill

Subject: FW: Message from KMBT_C6&52

Angie - we should be able to purchase the chair you want. Can you send me your unit number so we can bill the chair to
your department?

Nina - the Chair in the attached cut sheet is 'blocked' from purchase. Can you un-block it for a one-time Facilities
purchase?

Thanks,

Tom Gordon, RA

Pima County Facilities Management
Renovations & Interiors Manager
Ph. 520-724-3774

e-mail: tom.gordon@pima.gov

—--Qriginal Message-—-

From: Tony Cisneros

Sent: Friday, November 15, 2013 10:42 AM
To: Tom Gordon

Cc: Evangelina Quihuis

Subject: FW: Message from KMBT_C652

Tom
Could you assist Angie - thanks.

Anthony Cisneros
Maintenance Operations
Office 520-724-3037
Fax 520-724-3900

-—--Qriginal Message--—-

From: Evangelina Quibuis

Sent: Friday, November 15, 2013 10:28 AM
Ta: Tony Cisneros

Subject: FW: Message from KMBT_C652

Hi Anthony | have a request for District-5 we need to order an office chair please see attachment. Thanks let me know.

--—-0riginal Message-----
From: BOS-COPIER-100@ pima.gov [maiito:BOS-COPIER-100@pima.gov]

2



Sent: Friday, November 15, 2013 10:16 AM
To: Evangelina Quihuis {Angie)
Subject: Message from KMBT_C652



